
From Port Columbus International Airport:
Take International Gateway (west) out of the airport.  Merge onto I-670 West 
toward Columbus.  Go approximately 5.15 miles and take the US-23S/Third 
Street exit.  Merge onto Third Street and proceed to Damian Street (2nd 
Street from State Street).  Enter into Preferred Parking area - you can park 
on level A or B.   Take elevator to level 1, exit right and follow walkway 
toward the Sheraton Hotel.  Go left at steps for the Sheraton Hotel and 
follow into building.  Offices are on the 10th floor.

I-71 South:
Take I-71 South.  In Columbus, exit I-670 West.  Take I-670 to Third Street.  
Exit on Third Street.  Take Third Street south and proceed to Damian Street 
(2nd Street from State Street).  Enter into Preferred Parking area - you can 
park on level A or B.  Take elevator to level 1, exit right and follow walkway 
toward the Sheraton Hotel.  Go left at steps for the Sheraton Hotel and 
follow into building.  Offices are on the 10th floor.

I-70 West:
Take I-70 West to Fourth Street.  Take Fourth Street North to State Street.  
Turn left (west) on State Street.  Turn left (south) on Third Street and 
proceed to Damian Street (2nd Street from State Street).  Enter into 
Preferred Parking area - you can park on level A or B.  Take elevator to level 
1, exit right and follow walkway toward the Sheraton Hotel.  Go left at steps 
for the Sheraton Hotel and follow into building.  Offices are on the 10th floor.

I-71 North:
Take I-71 North to I-70 East.  Exit from I-70 at the Fourth Street Exit.  Take 
Fourth Street north to State Street.  Turn left (west) on State Street.  Turn 
left (south) on Third Street and proceed to Damian Street (2nd Street from 
State Street).  Enter into Preferred Parking area - you can park on level A or 
B.  Take elevator to level 1, exit right and follow walkway toward the Sher-
aton Hotel.  Go left at steps for the Sheraton Hotel and follow into building.  
Offices are on the 10th floor.

I-70 East:
Take I-70 East to Fourth Street.  Take Fourth Street north to State Street.  
Turn left (west) on State Street.  Turn left (south) on Third Street and 
proceed to Damian Street (2nd Street from State Street).  Enter into 
Preferred Parking area - you can park on level A or B.  Take elevator to level 
1, exit right and follow walkway toward the Sheraton Hotel.  Go left at steps 
for the Sheraton Hotel and follow into building.  Offices are on the 10th floor.

I-75 South:
Take I-75 South to Ohio Route 15.  Take Route 15 East, which becomes US 
23.  Take US 23 South to I-270.  Take I-270 East to I-71 South.  Follow 
directions for I-71 South above.
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